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Editorial 

This volume follows the format of recent issues in its thematic 
clustering of topics and in our continuing concern to cover a broad range 
of the folklore work now done in Australia, as well as of that fieldwork 
and scholarship which may be said to be more narrowly focused on 
Australian themes, experiences and attitudes. In this connection it is 
interesting that a record number of Australian universities and 
departments are represented in the valued and supportive contributors to 
this issue. 

As usual we endeavour to report on the work of individual scholars, 
collectors, performers and / or writers in our field, and we have, sadly, to 
record yet again the passing of several towering figures, two of whom in 
later 2003 were accorded state funerals by the appropriate state 
governments. 

We have not quite included all that was predicted in the Editorial to 
Number 1 7 and so will refrain from undue promises for the immediate 
future, choosing rather to now record the significant themes that seem to 
us to have emerged since the last annual issue. As with other countries, 
the discipline of folkloristics in Australia is sometimes quite close to 
ethnography, to sociology or to anthropology, much as it has long been 
in the Northern Hemisphere. Further, despite the downward pressure of 
the 'global' on the traditional identity and culture of smaller countries and 
regions, it is clear that the folk imagination refuses to be held captive to 
the merely pathetically present descriptive, urban, pessimistic or 
distressingly limited in behaviour, story and mores, or the plastic and the 
shoddy in material culture - something evidenced by the increasing 
public appetite for folk museums and regional collections of artifacts 
from earlier periods. 

Thus the third major section here, that concerned with 'neglected 
repositories for folk memory and timeless folk attitudes', illustrates how 
story and its lore are in no sense inhibited by the dread and even fearful 
present, but rather prefer to move more often into the fields of 'epic 
fantasy' or the urban Gothic. (For both of these may be said to have 
surpassed and even routed the lore of science fiction, so prominent for 
much of the twentieth century.) 

Similarly the directness of quiet nature writing also discussed in this 
section belies the pressures of the squalid city, of depressing 'greenhouse' 
efects, of terror and all the tragic consequences of the new economic 
order. This is, quite simply, a wish to retain the ubiquitous awarenesses 
of (western) man at the dawn of industrialism and the determination to 
savour traditional landscape and the wonders of flora and fauna. Of a 
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related interest here is the closely focussed paper on the 'Once and future 
[Australian regional] country' which is another act of resistance to the 
creation of ever larger political units, to the restriction and even 
annihilation of a sense of regional identity and so of so much personal 
individuality, with the counter of a preferred inherited experience that 
makes one different, proud, and resourceful, aware of the forces that have 
made the person an individual and so much the better to cope with the 
levelling down pressures on us all. 

• * 
While we have largely refrained from close analysis of the massive 

expansion of material in the area of terror, fear and (over-)reaction to this 
in recent years, it may not be inappropriate to comment on the 11 th 
Asian Media Information and Communication Conference held in Perth, 
W.A., in late June 2002. We quote from its rationale statement: Terrorism 
is in everyone's consciousness, evoking a wide range of emotions. It takes 
new forms and threatens international communities and global security. It 
raises deep concern about the roots of this phenomenon. It is a basic 
staple of the nightly TV news, morning newspapers and the Internet. 
And increasingly conflicts are among groups who differ from one another 
in terms of culture, race, physical appearance and religion. Ethnic 
conflicts in Asia in recent times have transformed international relations 
and governance, and impacted the institutional structures and operational 
effectiveness of groups engaged in crisis and conflict management. 

The conference was concerned with the fostering of balance over bias, 
communication over confrontation and insight over ignorance. It asked 
how terrorism should be defined and portrayed, and which stories should 
be told. There was concern to avoid both sensation and propaganda, and 
to provide thoughtful and regional communication, for 'the media generate 
information, symbols, impressions and ideas that are critical in the battle 
for the minds and hearts of nations and peoples'. Its abiding concern was 
- and is - to help all governmental, military, academic, social, religious 
and ethnic bodies to share insights and perspectives in addressing the 
magnitude and complexity of terrorism and conflicts in our region. 
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